Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

ORDINANCE NO. 615 N.S.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF
TIBURON REPEALING AND REPLACING SECTION 13-4 OF
ARTICLE II, CHAPTER 13, TITLE 1V OF THE TIBURON
MUNICIPAL CODE BY ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2025
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24,
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS PARTS 1, 2,25, 3,4, 5,
6,7,8,10,11 and 12) TOGETHER WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS
TO PARTS 1, 2,25, 3,4,5,6, 11

WHEREAS, the Town of Tiburon (“Town”) is required, pursuant to state law, to enforce
the 2025 Building Standards Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations, as adopted by the
California Standards Building Commission, subject to such local amendments as may be adopted
by the City in accordance with applicable law; and

WHEREAS, the Town of Tiburon desires to adopt the 2025 edition of the California
Building Standards Code by reference, including all parts thereof, to replace the currently
adopted edition, and to re-enact certain local amendments necessary to address local conditions;

and

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code §§17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 provide
that the City may make changes or modifications to the building standards contained in the
California Building Standards Code based upon express findings that such changes or
modifications are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical
conditions; and

WHEREAS, Public Resources Code §25402.1(h)2 establishes a process which allows
local amendments to the energy standards that are more stringent than the California Energy
Code, provided that such local standards are cost effective and will require buildings to be
designed to consume less energy than permitted by the California Energy Code; and

WHEREAS, the Town has made a commitment to accelerate climate action
implementation and has adopted a 2030 Climate Action Plan (CAP), adopted to implement
climate policies to achieve the goal to reduce community emissions 50% below 1990 levels by

2030.

WHEREAS, the proposed local amendments support the CAP goal by requiring that certain
additions or alterations to existing single-family buildings include additional energy efficiency

measures; and

WHEREAS, the proposed local amendments are also necessary to address local
climactic, geological and topographic conditions

WHEREAS, this ordinance is exempt from California Environmental Quality Act
(CEQA) under §15061(b)(3) on the grounds that these standards are more stringent than the State

Page 1 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

energy standards, there are no reasonably foreseeable adverse impacts and there is no possibility
that the activity in question may have a significant effect on the environment; and

WHEREAS, the proposed local amendments applicable to residential units in Parts 1, 2,
2.5, 3, 4, and 5 of the 2025 California Building Standards Code, are substantially equivalent to
local amendments previously adopted and effective prior to Oct. 1, 2025 as part of the 2022
California Building Standards Code triennially code cycle because they are carried forward from
a previously filed ordinance amending the 2022 edition of Title 24 and do not contain a material
change in regulatory effect to the existing standards.

WHEREAS, the proposed local amendments applicable to residential units in Parts 6 and
11 of the 2025 California Building Standards Code are necessary to implement the Town’s
General Plan adopted on May 22, 2023, and the Town’s adopted CAP which includes a
greenhouse gas emission reduction strategy adopted on September 21, 2022, and permit mixed-
fuel construction while incentivizing all-electric. are intended to incentivize all-electric
construction while permitting mixed-fuel, and

WHEREAS, The Town Council finds that the amendments made by this Ordinance are
necessary for the protection of the public health, safety, and welfare

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN
OF TIBURON :

The Town Council of the Town of Tiburon does ordain as follows:

Section 1. Findings.

A. The foregoing recitals are true and correct and are incorporated herein by reference each
as an integral part of this Ordinance. All Attachments hereto are hereby incorporated by

reference.

B. Climatic, Topographical and Geologic Findings. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code
§§17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5, the amendments, additions and deletions to the
California Building Standards Code contained in this ordinance of the 2025 California
Building Standards Code, including to Parts 1, 2, 2.5, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 11 are reasonably
necessary because of the local climatic, geological or topographical conditions described
below. California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5
require that findings be made in order to change or modify building standards found in
the California Building Standards Code based on local climatic, geologic, or topographic
conditions. Therefore, the Town of Tiburon hereby finds that these changes or
modifications to the Building Code as adopted herein are reasonably necessary because
of the following local climatic, geological and topographical conditions:

1. Climatic conditions:
a. Most of the annual rainfall in Tiburon occurs during the winter, it receives
no measurable precipitation between May and October. During this time,

Page 2 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

temperatures average between 60 and 85 degrees. These conditions
eliminate most of the moisture in the natural vegetation and heavily
wooded hillsides. The area also suffers from periodic droughts that can
extend the dry periods to other months of the year. These conditions can
be further exacerbated by occasional off-shore hot, dry, Santa-Ana winds.

b. Most of the annual rainfall in Tiburon occurs during the winter, and some
portions of Tiburon are subject to tidal influences, there are times that
flooding conditions occur in low-lying areas.

c. Tiburon is situated within a densely populated major metropolitan area
(the San Francisco Bay Area) that generates and releases into the
atmosphere significant quantities of greenhouse gases, which have
detrimental effects to the local climate as determined by the State of
California.

d. Climate change, due to emissions of greenhouse gases, has increased
average annual air temperatures in California by 1.80F since 1985,
resulting in more intense and frequent heat waves, more intense and
frequent drought, more severe storms and extreme weather events and
more severe and frequent wildfires. According to the California Climate
Change Assessment, annual average temperatures in Tiburon are expected
to rise between 4.40F and 7.20F by 2100, significantly exacerbating these
hazards. Local amendments to the municipal code establishing
electrification pursuant to this ordinance are reasonably necessary to
achieve greenhouse gas emission reductions called for in the Tiburon
Climate Action Plan 2030 to reduce the risks of climate shocks existing in
the community such as wildfires and drought, which will then reduce risks
of physical damage to critical infrastructure, property loss, and loss of life.
The use of electricity rather than natural gas in major remodels of single-
family dwellings will reduce greenhouse gas emissions contributing to the
effects of global warming. Increased wildfire risk in both severity and
frequency has been scientifically linked to global warming.

2. Geologic conditions:

a. Tiburon lies near several earthquake faults, including the very active San
Andreas Fault and the Hayward Fault, and there are significant potential
hazards such as road closures, fires, collapsed buildings, and isolation of
residents requiring assistance.

b. Much of the Downtown commercial area is located on bay alluvial soils,
which are subject to liquefaction in the event of an earthquake.

c. Tiburon lies in California Climate Zone 3 which is subject to coastal influence
with precipitation in the winter, but with greater rainfall between October and
March compared to other areas in Climate Zone 3.

Page 3 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

d. The Tiburon peninsula is adjacent to the San Francisco Bay which provides a
saltwater environment, higher wind exposure, varying tide rise, and is subject
to marine life and environmental protection requirements.

3. Topographic conditions:

a. Much of Tiburon is located in steep, hilly areas; many of the residential
areas are heavily landscaped; and many exist adjacent to hilly open space
areas which are characterized by dry vegetation and have limited access.
In addition, the steepness of grades located in the hills and dales results in
narrow and winding roads, and limited water supply.

b. The major arterial route between Tiburon and U. S. Highway 101 is
Tiburon Boulevard (State Highway 131). Should that highway become
impassable, the only alternative roadway on and off the Peninsula is
Paradise Drive, a narrow, winding road easily subject to closure in storms
and having an extensive history of lane failures due to unstable soils and
poor drainage. This would result in traffic congestion, severely limiting
emergency access.

4. Wildfire Risk:

Much of Tiburon is located within the designated Wildland Urban Interface
(WUI) and properties along Tiburon Ridge are classified by CAL FIRE as High
and Moderate Fire Hazard zones. Increased incidence of wildfires in both severity
and frequency has been scientifically linked to global warming. Accordingly,
local amendments to the municipal code establishing electrification requirements
for newly constructed buildings and major remodels of single-family dwellings
pursuant to this ordinance are reasonably necessary to achieve greenhouse gas
emission reductions that avoids heightened risks from climate shocks existing in
the community such as wildfires caused by global warming.

5. Flooding/Sea Level Rise:

a. The Tiburon peninsula is surrounded by bay waters. The Marin Shoreline Sea
Level Rise Vulnerability Assessment estimates that Tiburon properties likely
vulnerable to inundation in the near- and medium-term include the Downtown
area on Main Street, the Boardwalk Shopping Center, Bay Road and access to
the peninsula along Tiburon Boulevard from Highway 101, potentially cutting
off residents from critical services and destinations. The use of electricity
rather than natural gas will reduce greenhouse gas emissions contributing to
the effects of global warming, including extreme weather conditions that can
lead to flooding and sea level rise.

b. Increased flooding and sea level rise in both severity and frequency has been
scientifically linked to global warming. Accordingly, local amendments to the
municipal code establishing electrification requirements for major remodels of
single-family dwellings pursuant to this ordinance are reasonably necessary to
achieve greenhouse gas emission reductions that avoids heightened risks from

Page 4 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

climate shocks existing in the community such as sea level rise and flooding
caused by global warming.

6. Seismic Risk

The Tiburon peninsula is located in the seismically active San Francisco Bay
region. The San Andreas fault, located 9 miles east of Tiburon, was the source of
the magnitude 7.9 earthquake in 1906 and the magnitude 6.9 Loma Prieta
earthquake in 1989. The Hayward fault is located 7 miles to the east. The US
Geological Survey forecasts a 72% probability that California will experience at
least one earthquake of magnitude 6.7 or greater in the region before 2043. Local
amendments to the municipal code establishing electrification requirements
pursuant to this ordinance are reasonably necessary to avoid risks existing in the
community from gas leaks and fire caused by vibration and ground failure risks
from seismic events.

C. Cost Effectiveness Findings. The Town of Tiburon Town Council hereby determines
that the revised energy standards contained herein are cost-effective, based upon the
findings of the relevant and applicable 2025 Cost-Effectiveness Studies published, by
Frontier Energy, Inc. and Misti Bruceri & Associates LL.C on behalf of the California
Energy Codes and Standards Statewide Utility Program.

D. General Plan Consistency. :
a. The Town Council finds that the amendments adopted by this Ordinance to Parts
6 and 11 of Title 24 are consistent with the goals, policies, and greenhouse gas
reduction strategies set forth in the Tiburon 2040 General Plan. The amendments
to Parts 6 and 11, further the implementation of Policy S-2 (Renewable Energy),
including Program S-f (Building and Appliance Electrification) and Program S-h
(Community Energy Use), as well as Policy S-3 (Building Energy Efficiency),
including Program S-i (Green Building Regulations) and Program S-j (Energy
Efficiency Programs), all of which are further advanced through the amendments
in this Ordinance that establish higher standards for energy efficiency and the
electrification of buildings and vehicles.

b. The Town Council finds that the local amendments adopted by this Ordinance to
Parts 6 and 11 of Title 24 are consistent with the greenhouse gas reduction goals
of the Tiburon 2030 Climate Action Plan, adopted September 21, 2022, which set
the goal of reducing community greenhouse gas emissions 50% below Tiburon’s
1990 levels by 2030. The proposed local amendments support the Climate Action
Plan goals and policies, including but not limited to Action RE-C3 (Building and
Appliance Electrification) and Action LCT-C1 (Zero-Emission Vehicles), all of
which are further advanced through the amendments in this Ordinance that
establish higher standards for energy efficiency and the electrification of buildings
and vehicles.

c¢. The Town Council finds that the local amendments to Parts 6 and 11 of Title 24
permits mixed-fuel residential construction consistent with federal law while also
incentivizing all-electric construction as part of an adopted greenhouse gas
emissions reduction strategy.

Page 5 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086480F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

E. Substantial Equivalence. The Town Council determines that the re-enactment of the
proposed local residential amendments to Parts 1, 2, 3, 4, and 5 of Title 24 are
substantially equivalent to amendments previously adopted and filed with the California
Building Standards Commission as part of the 2022 California Building Standards Code
cycle. The re-enactment of these provisions has no material change in regulatory effect,
and the continued adoption is necessary to maintain consistency with existing local
standards that protect the public health, safety, and welfare.

F. CEQA Findings. The Town Council finds that the adoption of this Ordinance is
ministerially exempt from the requirements of CEQA and is also exempt pursuant to
Section 15061(b) (3) of the CEQA Guidelines.

Section 2. Adoption of 2025 California Building Standards Code

Tiburon Municipal Code Title IV, Chapter 13, Article II (Technical Codes) is hereby repealed
and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Article II. Technical Codes

13-4 Adoption by reference of the 2025 California Building Standards Code
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, for the installation
of plumbing, gas appliances and electrical systems, and for the storage and handling of
flammable liquids, the codes or portions thereof set forth in this article are adopted and are made
a part of this chapter by reference without further publication or posting thereof, and not less
than one certified copy, along with the deletions and exceptions therefrom and additions and
amendments thereto, shall be kept on file for use and examination by the public in the office of
the town clerk.
13-4.1 Building Code.
The Town Council hereby adopts, for the purpose of providing minimum requirements for the
protection of life, limb, health, property, safety and welfare of the general public, that certain
code known as the 2025 California Building Code (based on the 2025 International Building
Code), Volume 1 and Volume 2, including the following appendices: Appendix J as published
by the California Building Standards Commission in the California Code of Regulations, Title
24, Part 2, hereinafter referred to as the "California Building Code", save and except such
portions as are hereinafter amended or modified by Section 13-4.1.1 of this chapter.

The following codes, as approved by the California Building Standards Commission, are hereby

adopted by reference:
1) The 2025 California Administrative Code, Part 1 of the California Building Standards Code,

Title 24 California Code of Regulations;
2) The 2025 California Building Code, Part 2 of the California Building Standards Code, Title 24

California Code of Regulations, including Appendix J;
3) The 2025 California Residential Code, Part 2.5 of the California Building Standards Code,

Title 24 California Code of Regulations, including Appendix BB;

Page 6 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

4) The 2025 California Electrical Code, Part 3 of the California Building Standards Code, Title

24 California Code of Regulations;

5) The 2025 California Mechanical Code, Part 4 of the California Building Standards Code, Title
24 California Code of Regulations;

6) The 2025 California Plumbing Code, Part 5 of the California Building Standards Code, Title
24 California Code of Regulations;

7) The 2025 California Energy Code, Part 6 of the California Building Standards Code, Title 24
California Code of Regulations;

8) The 2025 California Wild-Land Urban Interface Code, Part 7 of the California Building
Standards Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations;

9) The 2025 California Historical Building Code, Part 8 of the California Building Standards
Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations;

10) The 2025 California Existing Building Code, Part 10 of the California Building Standards
Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations;

11) The 2025 California Green Building Standards Code, Part 11 of the California Building
Standards Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations; and

12) The 2025 California Referenced Standards Code, Part 12 of the California Building
Standards Code, Title 24 California Code of Regulations.

A copy of each code, subject to such amendments as may be adopted by the City in this Title 12,
is on file in the office of the Town Clerk. The provisions of this title, including said codes and
amendments thereto, shall be known as the building code of the Town.

Section 3. Amendments to the 2025 California Building Code
Section 13-4.1.1 of Article II, Chapter 13, Title IV of the Tiburon Municipal Code is hereby

repealed and replaced to read in its entirely as follows:

Unless otherwise expressly stated, when a section or subsection of the California Building
Standards Code is amended by this ordinance, only the portions specifically set forth are
amended, and all other portions, subsections, and provisions of that section not expressly
modified shall remain in full force and effect.

13-4.1.1 Amendments made to the 2025 California Building Code.

The 2025 California Building Code is amended to read as follows:

(a) Section 1.8.5.1 is amended to read as follows:
1.8.5.1 General. Subject to the provisions of law, including Code of Civil Procedure
Section 1822.50 et. seq., officers and agents of the Building Official may enter and
inspect public and private properties to secure compliance with the provisions of this
code and the rules and regulations promulgated by the department of housing and
community development. For limitations and additional information regarding
enforcement, see the following:
(The remainder of this section is unchanged.)

(b) Section 1.8.8.1 is amended to add the following as an additional paragraph at the end of
the existing section:

Page 7 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDE76C8803E

(©)

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if
required by Health and Safety Code section 19957.5, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access Appeals Board.
The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as generally described in
the administrative chapter of this code.

Chapter 1, Division II is modified as follows:

(M

@

&)

Section 104.4 Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to
enforce the provisions of this code, or where the building official has reasonable
cause to believe that there exists in a structure or on a premises a condition that is
contrary to or in violation of this code that makes the structure or premises unsafe,
dangerous or hazardous, the building official is authorized to enter the structure or
premises at all reasonable times to inspect or to perform the duties imposed by
this code if such structure or premises is occupied, the building official shall
present credentials to the occupant and request entry. If such structure or premises
is unoccupied, the building official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate
the owner, the owner’s authorized agent or other person having charge or control
of the structure or premises and request entry. If entry is refused, the building
official shall have recourse to every remedy provided by law to secure entry,
including the warrant provisions of Section 1822.50 et. seq. of the Code of Civil
Procedure of the State of California.

Section 105.2 is amended to delete subsections 2, 4, 5, 6 and 12, and to modify
subsections 1 and 7 to read as follows:

1. Detached accessory structures used as playhouses or play structures
provided that the structure:
a. Does not exceed one-hundred twenty (120) square feet in area and

is portable (i.e., is not anchored or affixed in any way);

b. Does not exceed twelve (12) feet in height; and
c. Contains no plumbing, electricity or heating or cooling appliances.
d. Does not exceed one-story.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, counter tops and similar finish work;
except that repaving and/or re-striping of parking lots shall require a
permit.

Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration.

1. All permits issued by the Building Official shall expire by limitation and
become null and void eighteen (18) months from the date the permit is
issued.

2. In instances where the permittee has proceeded with due diligence and
made substantial progress but is unable to complete the project because of
unforeseen circumstances beyond the control of the permittee, one
extension of up to six (6) months may be granted, without payment of

Page 8 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

additional charges or penalties. In determining whether due diligence has
been exercised, the Building Official shall consider whether work began
promptly after permit issuance, whether work was conducted on a regular
basis, and any other relevant facts.

3. If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 2 above, or if the six (6) month extension was not
provided under subsection 2, a Stop Work Order may be issued on the date
of expiration and work shall not recommence until the permit is
reactivated and extended. A reactivation and extension may be issued by
the Building Official once a reactivation/extension Charge equal to one (1)
times the original project construction permit fee is paid. A
reactivation/extension charge, for purposes of this section, is primarily a
penalty for failure to complete the project within the allotted time, and
secondarily a fee to recover the cost of providing additional building
inspection division services, and is defined as the subtotal of the building,
electrical, plumbing, mechanical, grading, and business license fee
portions of the original permit. A permit reactivated and extended under
this subsection shall be valid for an additional six (6) months beyond the
date of its expiration prior to the reactivation/extension granted pursuant to
this paragraph.

4. If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 3 above, a Stop Work Order may be issued on the date of
expiration and work shall not recommence until the permit is reactivated
and extended. Reactivation and extension of the permit for another six (6)
month period shall be allowed only if a Reactivation/Extension Charge
equal to three (3) times the original project construction permit fees, as
defined in subsection 3 above, is paid. A permit reactivated and extended
under this subsection shall be valid for an additional six (6) months
beyond the date of its expiration prior to the reactivation/extension granted
pursuant to this paragraph.

5. If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 4 above, a Stop Work Order shall be issued and the
matter referred to the Town Council for resolution. The Town Council
may reactivate and extend the permit for an additional six (6) months upon
submission and acceptance of a completion schedule for the project and
payment of five (5) times the original project construction permit fees (as
defined in subsection 2 above) as a Reactivation/Extension Charge. The
Town Council may, in its sole discretion, reduce the reactivation/extension
charge based on such reasons as the project's nearness to completion
and/or the cause of the delay.

6. If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 5 above, or pursuant to this subsection 6, a Stop Work
Order shall be issued and the matter referred to the Town Council for
resolution. The Town Council may impose additional requirements, such
as the retention of a qualified contractor for owner/builder projects or
retention of a qualified construction manager for a contracted project, in

Page 9 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope iD: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

4)

&)

(©6)

order to promote swift completion. The Town Council may reactivate and
extend the permit upon imposition of any such conditions deemed
reasonable, and payment of five (5) times the original project construction
permit fees (as defined is subsection 3 above) as a Reactivation/Extension
Charge.

Section 109.2 is amended to read as follows:

109.2 Schedule of Fees.

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and plumbing system
alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be required as set forth in
the Building Division Fee Schedule as adopted by resolution of the town council
and amended from time to time.

Section 109.4 is amended to read as follows:

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance.

Any person who commences any work without a permit on a building, structure,
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a penalty as set forth in the Town's Schedule of Fines,
established by resolution of the town council and amended from time to time.

Section 113.1 is amended to add the following as an additional paragraph at the
end of the existing section:

For appeals of non-administrative provisions of the code, the local appeals board
and the housing appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board,
except that if required by Health and Safety Code section 19957.5, the local
appeals board and the housing appeals board shall be the County of Marin’s
Disability Access Appeals Board. The town council shall hear appeals of
administrative provisions as generally described in the administrative chapter of

this code.

(d) Section 202. Definitions, is amended to change the definition of “Approved Agency” to
read as follows:

[A] Approved Agency. An established and recognized organization that is
regularly engaged in conducting tests, furnishing inspection services or furnishing
product evaluation or certification where such organization has been approved by
the building official. Approval shall be based on the review of the agency’s
quality control manuals and standard operating procedures in accordance with
ASTM E329-18.

[HCD1 & HCD 2] “Approved agency shall mean “Listing agency” and

“Testing agency.”

[DSA-SS, DSA-SS/CC] This term is synonymous with “laboratory of

record” as referenced in section 4-335 of the California Administrative

Code.

(e) Section 502.1 is amended to read as follows:
502.1 Address Numbers.

Page 10 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope I1D: 086480F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDET76C8803E

1. The following standards for address markings shall apply to residential buildings:

a.

All residential structures shall display a street number in a prominent
position so that it shall be easily visible from the street. The numerals in
these numbers shall be no less than four inches in height, and one-half
inch in width, of a color contrasting to the background and located so they
may be clearly seen and read. If a building is not easily visible from the
street, then the numbers are to be mounted at the access drive leading to
the building.

At each vehicular access to a multiple family dwelling complex having
four or more buildings, there shall be an illuminated diagrammatic
representation (plot plan) of the complex, which shows the location of the
viewer and the building units within the complex.

In multiple family dwelling complexes, any building having a separate
identifying factor other than the street number shall be clearly identified in
the manner described in subsection (a). Each individual unit of residence
shall have a unit identifying number, letter, or combination thereof
displayed upon the door.

Maps of the multiple family complex will be furnished to the police
department and applicable fire district upon completion of construction.
The maps shall include building identification and unit identification.
Buildings shall be numbered in such a manner and sequence as to meet
with the approval of the enforcing authority.

This section shall not prevent supplementary numbering such as reflective
numbers on street curbs or decorative numbering, but this shall be
considered supplemental only and shall not satisfy the requirements of this
section.

2. The following standards for address markings shall apply to commercial
buildings: ‘

a.

b.

The address number of every commercial building shall be located and
displayed so that it shall be easily visible from the street.

The numerals in these numbers shall be no less than six inches in height,
one-half inch in width, and of a color contrasting to the background. In
addition, any business which affords vehicular access to the rear through
any driveway, alleyway, or parking lot shall also display the same
numbers on the rear of the building.

When required by the Building Official, approved numbers or addresses
shall be placed on all new and existing buildings in such a position as to
be plainly visible and legible from the fire apparatus road at the back of a
property or where rear parking lots or alleys provide an acceptable
vehicular access. Number height and width shall comply with Section
501.2.

® Section 903.2, The Exception is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required.
Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be

Page 11 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

provided in the locations described in this section, provided that where applicable
code provisions adopted by the Tiburon Fire Protection District or Southern
Marin Fire Protection District are more restrictive, the more restrictive provisions

shall control.

Exception: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively for
telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution
equipment, batteries not required to have an automatic sprinkler system by
Section 1207 of the California Fire Code for energy storage systems and standby
engines, provided that those spaces or areas are equipped throughout with an
automatic smoke detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 and are
separated from the remainder of the building by not less than 1-hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 or not less than 2-hour horizontal
assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both.

(2) Section 1015.2 is modified as follows:

1015.2 Where required. Guards shall be located along open-sided walking
surfaces, such as mezzanines, equipment platforms, aisles, stairs, ramps and
landings that are located more than 30 inches (762 mm) measured vertically to the
floor or grade below at any point within 36 inches (914 mm) horizontally to the
edge of the open side and at the perimeter of the occupiable roofs. Guards shall be
adequate in strength and attachment in accordance with Section 1607.8. Guards
are also required at waterfront bulkheads, fixed piers and gangways.

Exception: Guards are not required for the following locations:

1. On the loading side of loading docks or piers.

2. On the audience side of stages and raised platforms, including stairs leading up
to the stage and raised platforms.

3. On raised stage and platform floor areas, such as runways, ramps and side
stages used for entertainment or presentations.

4. At vertical openings in the performance area of stages and platforms.

5. At elevated walking surfaces appurtenant to stages and platforms for access to
and utilization of special lighting or equipment.

6. Along vehicle service pits not accessible to the public.

7. In assembly seating areas at cross aisles in accordance with Section 1029.17.2.
8. On the loading side of station platforms on fixed guideway transit or passenger
rail systems.

9. Portions of an occupiable roof located less than 30 inches (762 mm) measured
vertically to adjacent unoccupiable roof areas where approved guards are present
at the perimeter of the roof.

10. At portions of an occupiable roof where an approved barrier is provided.

11. Elevated facility observation station access hatches at detention facilities.

(h) Section 1505 is amended to read as follows:

Page 12 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(i)

The roof covering on any structure regulated by this code shall be as specified in
California Building Code Chapter 15 with the following conditions:

1. All new buildings and new additions shall have at least a Class A-listed or
noncombustible roof covering.
2. Where alterations or repairs to existing roofs involve more than fifty (50)

percent of the total area of an existing building within a one-year time
period, the entire roof shall be retrofitted with at least a Class A-listed or
noncombustible roof.

3. Where applicable code provisions adopted by the Tiburon Fire Protection
District or Southern Marin Fire Protection District are more restrictive, the
more restrictive provisions shall control.

Appendix J "GRADING" is modified as follows:

(N J103 “Permits Required” is amended, to add the following:
J103.3 Grading Permit Fees. Fees shall be as set forth in the Building Division
Fee Schedule established by resolution of the town council as amended from time
to time.

2 J110 “Erosion Control” is amended, to add the following:
J110.3 Mud, Loose Dirt, or Debris on Public Street. No person, firm or
corporation who has a valid building, demolition or grading permit shall permit
any mud, loose dirt or debris to be removed from the job site and deposited on
any public street or sidewalk.

13-4.2.1 Amendments to the 2025 California Residential Code.
The 2025 California Residential Code is amended as follows:

(a)

(b)

(©)

Section 1.8.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

1.8.5.1 General. Subject to the provisions of law, including Code of Civil Procedure
Section 1822.50 et. seq., officers and agents of the Building Official may enter and
inspect public and private properties to secure compliance with the provisions of this
code and the rules and regulations promulgated by the department of housing and
community development. For limitations and additional information regarding
enforcement, see the following:

(The remainder of this section is unchanged.)

Section 1.8.8.1 is amended to delete the second paragraph and add the following

paragraph to the end of the section:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if
required by Health and Safety Code section 19957.5, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access Appeals Board.
The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as generally described in
the administrative chapter of this code.

Chapter 1, Division II is modified as follows:

Page 13 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(D

@

&)

Section R104.4 Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to
enforce the provisions of this code, or where the building official has reasonable
cause to believe that there exists in a structure or upon a premises a condition that
is contrary to or in violation of this code that makes the structure or premises
unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the building official is authorized to enter the
structure or premises at all_reasonable times to inspect or to perform the duties
imposed by this code. If such structure or premises is occupied, the building
official shall present credentials to the occupant and request entry. If such
structure or premises is unoccupied, the building official shall first make a
reasonable effort to locate the owner, the owner's authorized agent, or other
person having charge or control of the structure or premises and request entry. If
entry is refused, the building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided
by law to secure entry, including the warrant provisions of Section 1822.50 et.
seq. of the Code of Civil Procedure of the State of California

Section R105.2 is amended to delete (building) subsections 2, 3, 4, 5, 9 and 10,
and to modify subsections 1 and 6 to read as follows:

1. Detached accessory structures used as playhouses or play structures
provided that the structure:
a. Does not exceed one-hundred twenty (120) square feet in area and

is portable (i.e., is not anchored or affixed in any way);

b. Does not exceed twelve (12) feet in height; and
c. Contains no plumbing, electricity or heating or cooling appliances.
d. Does not exceed one-story.

6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, counter tops and similar finish work;
except that repaving and/or re-striping of parking lots shall require a
permit.

Section R105.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration.

1. All permits issued by the Building Official shall expire by limitation and
become null and void eighteen (18) months from the date the permit is
issued.

2. In instances where the permittee has proceeded with due diligence and
made substantial progress but is unable to complete the project because of
unforeseen circumstances beyond the control of the permittee, one
extension of up to six (6) months may be granted, without payment of
additional charges or penalties. In determining whether due diligence has
been exercised, the Building Official shall consider whether work began
promptly after permit issuance, whether work was conducted on a regular
basis, and any other relevant facts.

3. If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 2 above or if the six (6) extension was not provided
under subsection 2, a Stop Work Order may be issued on the date of
expiration and work shall not recommence until the permit is reactivated
and extended. A reactivation and extension may be issued by the Building

Page 14 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(d)

Official once a reactivation/extension Charge equal to one (1) times the
original project construction permit fee is paid. A reactivation/extension
charge, for purposes of this section, is primarily a penalty for failure to
complete the project within the allotted time, and secondarily a fee to
recover the cost of providing additional building inspection division
services, and is defined as the subtotal of the building, electrical,
plumbing, mechanical, grading, and business license fee portions of the
original permit. A permit reactivated and extended under this subsection
shall be valid for an additional six (6) months beyond the date of its
expiration prior to the reactivation/extension granted pursuant to this
paragraph.

If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 3 above, a Stop Work Order may be issued on the date of
expiration and work shall not recommence until the permit is reactivated
and extended. Reactivation and extension of the permit for another six (6)
month period shall be allowed only if a Reactivation/Extension Charge
equal to three (3) times the original project construction permit fees, as
defined in subsection 3 above, is paid. A permit reactivated and extended
under this subsection shall be valid for an additional six (6) months
beyond the date of its expiration prior to the reactivation/extension granted
pursuant to this paragraph.

If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 4 above, a Stop Work Order shall be issued and the
matter referred to the Town Council for resolution. The Town Council
may reactivate and extend the permit for an additional six (6) months upon
submission and acceptance of a completion schedule for the project and
payment of five (5) times the original project construction permit fees (as
defined in subsection 2 above) as a Reactivation/Extension Charge. The
Town Council may, in its sole discretion, reduce the reactivation/extension
charge based on such reasons as the project's nearness to completion
and/or the cause of the delay.

If the project is not completed within the six (6) month extension allowed
under subsection 5 above, or pursuant to this subsection 6, a Stop Work
Order shall be issued and the matter referred to the Town Council for
resolution. The Town Council may impose additional requirements, such
as the retention of a qualified contractor for owner/builder projects or
retention of a qualified construction manager for a contracted project, in
order to promote swift completion. The Town Council may reactivate and
extend the permit upon imposition of any such conditions deemed
reasonable, and payment of five (5) times the original project construction
permit fees (as defined is subsection 3 above) as a Reactivation/Extension
Charge.

Section R321.1.1 is amended by adding the following sentence at the end of this section:

Page 15 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope iD: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(e)

0]

"Guards are also required at waterfront bulkheads, fixed piers and gangways for these
portions of open-sided walking surfaces only."

Section R309.3, is amended to add the following to the beginning of the section, to read
as follows:

R309.3 Dwelling unit automatic sprinkler systems. Where required.

Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be
provided in the locations described in this section, provided that where applicable
code provisions adopted by the Tiburon Fire Protection District or Southern
Marin Fire Protection District are more restrictive, the more restrictive provisions
shall control.

R309.3.1_General. The design and installation of residential fire sprinkler systems
shall be in accordance with NFPA 13D or Section R309.3, which shall be
considered equivalent to NFPA 13D. Partial residential sprinkler systems shall be
permitted to be installed only in buildings not required to be equipped with an
automatic sprinkler system. Section R309.3 shall apply to stand-alone and
multipurpose wet-pipe sprinkler systems that do not include the use of antifreeze.
A multipurpose fire sprinkler system shall supply domestic water to both fire
sprinklers and plumbing fixtures. A stand-alone automatic sprinkler system shall
be separate and independent from the water distribution system.

Section R308.1 is amended to read as follows:
R308.1 Address Numbers. The following standards for address markings shall apply to

residential buildings:

a.

All residential structures shall display a street number in a prominent position so

that it shall be easily visible from the street. The numerals in these numbers shall

be no less than four inches in height, and one-half inch in width, of a color
contrasting to the background and located so they may be clearly seen and read. If

a building is not easily visible from the street, then the numbers are to be mounted

at the access drive leading to the building.

b. At each vehicular access to a multiple family dwelling complex having
four or more buildings, there shall be an illuminated diagrammatic
representation (plot plan) of the complex, which shows the location of the
viewer and the building units within the complex.

C. In multiple family dwelling complexes, any building having a separate
identifying factor other than the street number shall be clearly identified in
the manner described in subsection a. above. Each individual unit of
residence shall have a unit identifying number, letter, or combination
thereof displayed upon the door.

d. Maps of the multiple family complex will be furnished to the police
department and applicable fire district upon completion of construction.
The maps shall include building identification and unit identification.

Page 16 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(2

e. Buildings shall be numbered in such a manner and sequence as to meet
with the approval of the enforcing authority.
f. This section shall not prevent supplementary numbering such as reflective

numbers on street curbs or decorative numbering, but this shall be
considered supplemental only and shall not satisfy the requirements of this
section.

Section R905.1 is amended to read as follows:
R905.1 Roof covering application. The roof covering on any structure regulated by this
code shall be as specified in California Residential Code Chapter 9 with the following

conditions:

1. All new buildings and new additions shall have at least a Class A-listed or
noncombustible roof covering.
2. Where alterations or repairs to existing roofs involve more than fifty percent of

the total area of an existing building within a one-year time period, the entire roof
shall be retrofitted with at least a Class A-listed or noncombustible roof.

3. Where applicable code provisions adopted by the Tiburon Fire Protection District
or Southern Marin Fire Protection District are more restrictive, the more
restrictive provisions shall control.

13-4.3.1 Amendments made to the 2025 California Plumbing Code.
The 2025 California Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

(2)

(b

(©)

Section 1.8.5.1 is amended to modify the first paragraph to read as follows:

Section 1.8.5.1 General. Subject to the provisions of law, including Section 1822.50 et.
seq. of the Code of Civil Procedure of the State of California, officers and agents of the
Building Official may enter and inspect public and private properties to secure
compliance with the provisions of this code. For limitations and additional information
regarding enforcement, see the following:

(The remainder of this section is unchanged)

Section 1.8.8.1 is amended to delete the second paragraph and add the following
paragraph to the end of the section:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if
required by Health and Safety Code section 19957.5, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access Appeals Board.
The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as generally described in
the administrative chapter of this code.

Chapter 1, Division II is amended as follows:
(nH Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:
These regulations shall be known as the California Plumbing Code, may be cited

as such, and will be referred to herein as "this code".
2) Section 103.1 is amended to add the following sentence at the end of the section

to read as follows:

Page 17 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope {D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDE76C8803E

The term "AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION” shall mean the Building
Official or his duly authorized representative.

@) Section 104.3 is amended to replace the existing first paragraph to read as
follows:
104.3 Application. To obtain a permit, the applicant shall apply to the Authority
Having Jurisdiction for that purpose. Every such application shall:
(The remainder of this section is unchanged.)

(5) Section 104.3.2 is amended to read as follows:
104.3.2 General. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the provisions of this
section and as set forth in the Building Division Fee Schedule adopted by
resolution of the town council and amended from time to time.

(6) Section 104.5 is amended to read as follows:
104.5 Fees. Any person desiring a permit required by this code shall, at the time
of issuance therefore, pay a fee, the fee which shall be as set forth in the Building
Division Fee Schedule adopted by resolution of the town council and amended
from time to time.

(7 Section 105.2.6 is amended to replace the fourth paragraph with the following:
To obtain re-inspection, the applicant shall first pay the re-inspection fee in
accordance with the Building Division Fee Schedule adopted by resolution of the
town council and amended from time to time.

(9)  Section 203.0 is amended to change the following definition to read as follows:
"AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION". The Authority Having Jurisdiction
shall mean the Building Official or his duly authorized representative.

13-4.4.1 Amendments made to the 2025 California Electrical Code.
The 2025 California Electrical Code is amended or modified as follows:

(a)

(b)

(©)

Section 89.108.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

89.108.4.2 Fees. Any person desiring a permit required by this code shall, at the time of
issuance thereof, pay a fee, which shall be as set forth in the Building Division Fee
Schedule adopted by resolution of the town council and amended from time to time.

Section 89.108.5.1 is amended to modify the first sentence to read as follows:

Section 89.108.5.1 General. Subject to other provisions of law, including Section 1822.50
et. seq. of the Code of Civil Procedure of the State of California, officers and agents of
the Building Official may enter and inspect public and private properties to secure
compliance with the provisions of this code.
(The remainder of this section is unchanged.)

Section 89.108.8.1 is amended by adding the following sentence thereto to the end of the
section:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if
required by Health and Safety Code section 19957.5, the local appeals board and the
housing appeals board shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access Appeals Board.

Page 18 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as generally described in
the administrative chapter of this code.

(d)  Article 100 is amended to change the following definition to read as follows:
Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ) - The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall mean the
Building Official or his or her duly authorized representative.

(e) Section 210.12(E) is amended as follows:

(E) Branch Circuit Wiring Extensions, Modifications, or Replacements.

If provisions of this section shall apply to existing dwelling units when electrical service
panels or sub-panels are replaced or upgraded. In any of the areas specified in 210.12 (B)
or (C), or (D) is modified, replaced, or extended, the branch circuit shall be protected by
one of the following:

(1) By any of the means described in 210.12(A)(1) through (A) (6).

(2) A listed outlet branch-circuit-type AFCI located at the first receptacle outlet of the

existing branch circuit.

Exception: AFCI protection shall not be required where the extension of the existing
branch circuit conductors is not more than 1.8 m (6 ft) and does not include any
additional outlets or devices, other than splicing devices. This measurement shall not
include the conductors inside an enclosure, cabinet, or junction box.

13-4.5 Fire Code.

The Town Council hereby adopts, for the purpose of providing minimum requirements for the
protection of life, limb, health, property, safety and welfare of the general public, that certain
code known as the 2025 California Fire Code (as adopted and modified by the current Tiburon
Fire Protection District and Southern Marin Fire Protection District ordinances), which Code and
ordinances are hereby referred to, ratified, and made a part hereof as if fully set forth herein.
Copies of said code and ordinances are on file and available for public inspection in the office of

the town clerk.

13-4.6. Housing Code.

The Town Council hereby adopts, for the purpose of providing minimum requirements for the
protection of life, limb, health, property, safety and welfare of the general public, that certain
code known as the Uniform Housing Code (1997 Edition, as published by the International
Conference of Building Officials), hereinafter referred to as the "Uniform Housing Code", save
and except such portions as are hereinafter changed or modified by Section 13-4.6.1 of this

chapter.

13-4.6.1 Amendments made to the 1997 Uniform Housing Code.
The 1997 Uniform Housing Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 103 is amended to revise the second sentence of the first paragraph to read as

follows:
Such occupancies in existing buildings may be continued as provided by the California
Existing Building Code, as contained in Title 24, Part 10 of the California Code of

Page 19 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(b)

©)

(d)

(e)

®

@
(h)

Regulations, except such structures as are found to be substandard as defined by this
code.

Section 104.1 is amended to read as follows:

All buildings or structures that are required to be repaired under the provisions of this
code shall be subject to the provisions of the California Existing Building Code, as
contained in Title 24, Part 10 of the California Code of Regulations.

Section 201.1 is amended to revise the first paragraph to read as follows:

The Building Official and their designees are hereby authorized and directed to enforce
all of the provisions of this code. For such purposes, such officials shall have the powers
of law enforcement officers.

Section 201.2 is amended to read as follows:

Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the provisions of this title,
or whenever the Building Official or his authorized representative has reasonable cause to
believe that there exists in any building or upon any premises an immediate threat to
health and safety, the Building Official or his authorized representative may enter such
building or premises at all reasonable times to inspect the same or to perform any duty
imposed upon the Building Official by this code; provided, that if such building or
premises be occupied he shall first present proper credentials and demand entry; and if
such building or premises be unoccupied he shall first make a reasonable effort to locate
the owner or other persons having charge or control of the building or premises and
demand entry. If such entry is refused, the Building Official, or his authorized
representative, shall have recourse to every remedy provided by law to secure entry,
including the warrant provisions of Section 1822.50 et seq. of the Code of Civil
Procedure of the State of California.

Section 203.1 is amended by adding the following sentence to the end of the section
thereto:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the housing advisory and
appeals board shall be the Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board. If required by Health
and Safety Code section 19957.5, the housing advisory and appeals board shall be the
County of Marin’s Disability Access Appeals Board. The town council shall hear
appeals of administrative provisions of this code.

Section 301 is amended to read as follows:
No building or structure regulated by this code shall be erected, constructed, enlarged
altered, repaired, moved, improved, removed, converted or demolished unless a separate

permit for each building or structure has first been obtained as required by the Building
Code.

Section 302 is deleted.

Section 303 is amended to read as follows:

Page 20 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

Buildings or structures within the scope of this code and all construction or work for
which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the Building Official as
provided by this code and in accordance with the applicable requirements of the Building
Code.

Section 401 is amended to add or change certain definitions as follows:

(O The definition of "Building Code" in Section 401 is amended to read as follows:
BUILDING CODE is the California Building Code as adopted with amendments
by the Town of Tiburon.

(2) A definition for "Building Official" is added to Section 401 to read as follows:
BUILDING OFFICIAL is the Building Official in the Community Development
Department of the Town of Tiburon.

3) The definition of "Mechanical Code" in Section 401 is amended to read as
follows:

MECHANICAL CODE is the California Mechanical Code as adopted with
amendments by the Town of Tiburon.

@ The definition of "Plumbing Code" in Section 401 is amended to read as follows:
PLUMBING CODE is the California Plumbing Code as adopted with
amendments by the Town of Tiburon.

13-4.7.1 Amendments made to the 2025 California Mechanical Code.
The2025 California Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

(2)

(b)

(©)

(d)

Chapter 1, Division I, Section 1.8.8.1 is amended by adding the following sentence to the
end of the section thereto:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the board of appeals shall be the
Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if required by Health and Safety Code
section 19957.5, the board of appeals shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access
Appeals Board. The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as
generally described in the administrative chapter of this code.

Chapter 1, Division II is amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the California Mechanical Code, may be cited as
such, and will be referred to herein as "this code".

Section 104.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

104.3.2 General. Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the provisions of this section
and as set forth in the Building Division Fee Schedule adopted by resolution of the town
council and amended from time to time.

Section 104.5 is amended to read as follows:

104.5 Fees. Any person desiring a permit required by this code shall, at the time of
issuance for the permit, pay a fee, the fee for which shall be as set forth in the Building
Division Fee Schedule adopted by resolution of the town council and amended from time

to time.

Page 21 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-EODE76C8803E

(e)

)

(2

Section 105.2.6 is amended to replace the third paragraph with the following:

To obtain re-inspection, the applicant shall first pay the re-inspection fee in accordance
with the Building Division Fee Schedule adopted by resolution of the town council and
amended from time to time.

Section 107.1 is amended by adding the following to the end of the existing section
thereto:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the board of appeals shall be the
Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if required by Health and Safety Code
section 19957.5, the board of appeals shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access
Appeals Board. The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions as
generally described in the administrative chapter of this code.

Section 203.0 is amended to change the following definition as follows:

The definition of "AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION" is amended to read as
follows:

AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION — The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall
mean the Building Official or his duly authorized representative.

13-4.8 Dangerous Building Code.

The Dangerous Building Code of the Town shall be the Uniform Code for the Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings (1997 edition, as published by the International Conference of Building
Officials), on file with the office of the Town Clerk, which Code is hereby referred to, adopted
and made a part hereof as if fully set forth herein, save and except such portions as are
hereinafter amended or modified by Section 13-4.8.1 of this chapter.

13-4.8.1 Amendments made to the 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings.

The 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is amended as follows:

(2)

(b)

Section 103 is amended to read as follows:

All buildings or structures which are required to be repaired under the provisions of this
code shall be subject to the provisions of the California Existing Building Code, as
contained in Title 24, Part 10 of the California Code of Regulations.

Section 201.3 is amended to read as follows:

Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the provisions of this title,
or whenever the Building Official or his authorized representative has reasonable cause to
believe that there exists in any building or upon any premises an immediate threat to
health and safety, the Building Official or his authorized representative may enter such
building or premises at all reasonable times to inspect the same or to perform any duty
imposed upon the Building Official by this code; provided, that if such building or
premises be occupied he shall first present proper credentials and demand entry; and if
such building or premises be unoccupied he shall first make a reasonable effort to locate

Page 22 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDE76C8803E

(©)

(d)

(e)

the owner or other persons having charge or control of the building or premises and
demand entry. If such entry is refused, the Building Official, or his authorized
representative, shall have recourse to every remedy provided by law to secure entry,
including the warrant provisions of Section 1822.50 et seq. of the Code of Civil
Procedure of the State of California.

Section 204 is amended to read as follows:

All buildings or structures within the scope of this code and all construction or work for
which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the Building Official as
provided in this code and in accordance with the applicable requirements of the Building
Code.

Section 205.1 is amended by adding the following sentence to the end of that section
thereto:

For appeal of non-administrative provisions of the code, the board of appeals shall be the
Tiburon Building Code Appeals Board, except that if required by Health and Safety Code
section 19957.5, the board of appeals shall be the County of Marin’s Disability Access
Appeals Board. The town council shall hear appeals of administrative provisions of this
code.

Section 301 is amended to change certain definitions as follows:

(1) The definition of "Building Code" is amended to read as follows:
BUILDING CODE is the California Building Code as adopted with amendments
by the Town of Tiburon.

2) A definition of "Building Official" is added to read as follows:
BUILDING OFFICIAL is the Building Official in the Community Development
Department of the Town of Tiburon.

13-4.9.1 Amendments made to the 2025 CALGreen Code.
The California Green Building Standards Code is amended as follows:

(a)

(b)

For new residential construction only (not including additions), the Town Council hereby
adopts as mandatory measures the following otherwise voluntary divisions of Appendix
A4:

Division A4.1 (Planning & Design);

Division A4.3 (Water Efficiency & Conservation);

Division A4.4 (Material Conservation and Resource Efficiency);

Division A4.5 (Environmental Quality); and

Division A4.6 (Tier | & Tier 2), deleting all Tier 2 measures.

I

For new nonresidential construction only (not including additions), the Town Council
hereby adopts as mandatory measures the following otherwise voluntary divisions of
Appendix AS5:

L. Division A5.1 (Planning & Design);

2. Division A5.3 (Water Efficiency & Conservation);

3. Division A5.4 (Material Conservation and Resource Efficiency);

4. Division A5.5 (Environmental Quality); and

Page 23 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(©)

5. Division A5.6 (Tier 1 & Tier 2), deleting all Tier 2 measures.

Section 202 of Chapter 2 is hereby amended to add, revise or delete the following

definitions:

Automatic Load Management System (ALMS). A control system designed to manage
load across one or more electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) circuits or panels and
to share electrical capacity and/or automatically manage power at each connection point.
ALMS systems shall be designed to deliver no less than 3.3 kVa (208.240 volt, 16-
ampere) to each EV Capable, EV Ready or EVCS space served by the ALMS, and meet
the requirements of California Electrical Code Article 625. The connected amperage to
the building site for the EV charging infrastructure shall not be lower than the required
connected amperage per California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24 Part 11.

Direct Current Fast Charging (DCFC). A parking space provided with electrical
infrastructure that meets the following conditions:
i. A minimum of 48 kVa (480 volt, 100-ampere) capacity wiring.
ii. Electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) located within three (3) feet of
the parking space providing a minimum capacity of 80-ampere.

Electric Vehicle Charging Station (EVCS). A parking space that includes installation
of electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) at an EV Ready space. An EVSC space may
be used to satisfy EV Ready space requirements. EVSE shall be installed in accordance
with the California Electrical Code, Article 625.

Level 2 (L.2) EV Capable. A parking space provided with electrical infrastructure that meets the
following requirements:

i. Conduit that links a listed electrical panel with sufficient capacity to a junction
box or receptacle located within three (3) feet of the parking space.

ii. The conduit shall be designed to accommodate at least 8.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 40-
ampere) per parking space. Conduit shall have a minimum nominal trade size of |
inch inside diameter and may be sized for multiple circuits as allowed by the
California Electrical Code. Conduit shall be installed at a minimum in spaces that
will be inaccessible after construction, either trenched underground or where
penetrations to walls, floors, or other partitions should otherwise be required for
future installation of branch circuits, and such additional elements deemed
necessary by the Building Official. Construction documents shall indicate future
completion of conduit from the panel to the parking space, via the installed
inaccessible conduit.

iii. The electrical panel shall reserve a space for a 40-ampere overcurrent protection
device spaces(s) for EV charging, labeled in the panel directory as “EV
CAPABLE.”

iv. Electrical load calculations shall demonstrate that the electrical panel service
capacity and electrical system, including any on-site distribution transformer(s),
have sufficient capacity to simultaneously charge all EVs at all required EV
spaces at a minimum of 40 amperes.

Page 24 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusigri Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

v. The parking space shall contain signage with at least a 12” font adjacent to the
parking space indicating the space is EV Capable.

Level 1 (1) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit
with the following requirements:

i. A minimum of 2.2 kVa (110/120 volt, 20-ampere) capacity wiring.

ii. A receptacle labeled “Electric Vehicle Outlet” or electric vehicle supply
equipment located within three (3) feet of the parking space. If EVSE is provided
the minimum capacity of the EVSE shall be 16-ampere.

iii. Conduit oversized to accommodate future Level 2 EV Ready (208/240, 40-
ampere) at each parking space.

Level 2 (L2) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit
with the following requirements:

i. A minimum of 8.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 40-ampere) capacity wiring.

ii. A receptacle labeled “Electric Vehicle Outlet”, or electric vehicle supply
requirement located within three (3) feet of the parking space. If EVSE is
provided the minimum capacity of the EVSE shall be 30-ampere.

iii. Low Power Level 2 (L2) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a
complete electric circuit with the following requirements:

iv. A minimum of 4.1 kVa (208/240 volt, 20-ampere) capacity wiring.

v. A receptacle labeled “Electric Vehicle Outlet”, or electric vehicle supply
requirement located within three (3) feet of the parking space. If EVSE is
provided the minimum capacity of the EVSE shall be 16-ampere.

vi.  Conduit oversized to accommodate future Level 2 EV Ready (208/240 volt,
40- ampere) at each parking space.

Low Power Level 2 Electric Vehicle (EV) Charging Receptacle is deleted.

(d)

Section 4.106.4.1 is replaced to read as follows:

4.106.4.1 One- and two-family dwellings and town-houses. For each new dwelling
unit or when alterations to an existing building include upgrades to the service panel, the
project shall install a list raceway to accommodate a dedicated 208/240-volt branch
circuit. The raceway shall originate at the main service or subpanel and shall terminate
into a listed cabinet, box or other enclosure in close proximity to the proposed location
of an EV charger. Raceways are required to be continuous at enclosed, inaccessible or
concealed areas and spaces. The service panel and/or subpanel shall provide capacity to
install a 40-ampere 208/240-volt minimum dedicated branch circuit and space(s)
reserved to permit installation of a branch circuit overcurrent protective device.

Exception: A raceway is not required if a minimum 40-ampere 208/240-volt
dedicated EV branch circuit is installed in close proximity to the proposed
location of an EV charger at the time of original construction in accordance with
the California Electrical Code

Page 25 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(e)

4.106.4.2.2 Additions and alterations to multifamily dwellings and parking facilities.
When additions or alterations to existing buildings upgrade the service panel, when the
parking lot surface is modified, including the removal of paving material and curbing, or
when parking spaces are added, the project shall comply with section A4.106.8.2.1 to
facilitate the installation and use of EV ready spaces.

Section A5.106.5.3.3 is added to Section A5.106.5.3 to read as follows:

A5.106.5.3.3 Additions and alterations to nonresidential occupancies and parking
facilities. When additions or alterations to existing buildings upgrade the service panel,
when the parking lot surface is modified, including the removal of paving material and
curbing, or when parking spaces are added, the project shall comply with 5.106.5.3 to
facilitate the installation and use of EV ready spaces

13-4.11 Amendments made to the 2025 Energy Code

The 2025 Energy Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 100.0 of Subchapter 1 is amended to add new section (i) as follows:

i. Single-Family Building Remodel Energy Reach Code. In addition to all
requirements of the California Energy Code applicable to existing single-family
building additions and alterations, the energy efficiency and renewable energy
measures specified in Section 150.0(w) shall be required for additions or
alterations to an existing single-family residential mixed-fuel building which
equal or exceed 500 square feet of interior conditioned space.

(b) Section 100.1(b) — Definitions — of Subchapter 1 of the 2025 California Energy Code

is amended by adding the following definition:

“Covered Project(s)” means additions or alterations, as described below, to a single-
family residential building originally permitted for construction on or before
December 31, 2010, which equal or exceeds 500 square feet of interior conditioned
space. Any addition or alteration to the same structure in the preceding 36 months
shall be counted towards the 500 square feet threshold, except those additions or
alterations made prior to the initial adoption of this ordinance. When any changes are
made in the building, such as walls, columns, beams, girders, floor or ceiling joists
and coverings (subfloor and drywall), roof rafters, roof diaphragms, foundations, piles
or retaining walls with similar components, the floor area of all rooms affected by
such changes shall be included in computing floor areas for the purpose of applying
this definition.

This definition does not apply to project scopes that are solely limited to any of the
following: the replacement and upgrading of residential roof coverings, exterior wall
finishes and/or floor finishes; alterations that add no more than 75 square feet of
fenestration; alterations that add no more than 16 square feet of skylight area with a

Page 26 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

maximum U-factor of 0.55 and a maximum SHGC of 0.30; or alterations that are
limited to providing access for persons with disabilities. A Covered Project shall not
include a project that is considered to be a newly constructed building under the
California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6. The final determination of whether a project
meets the definition of a Covered Project shall be made by the Building Official or
designee.

(¢) Section 150.0 SINGLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS — MANDATORY
FEATURES AND DEVICES, first two paragraphs are modified to read as follows:

Existing single-family residential buildings shall comply with the applicable
requirements of Sections 150(a) through 150(v), and additions or alterations to an
existing single-family residential building which equal or exceed 500 square feet of
interior conditioned space, other than projects identified as all-electric construction
for newly constructed buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of
Section 150.0(w).

NOTE: The requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150(v) apply to newly constructed
buildings. Sections 150.2(a) and 150.2(b) specify which requirements of Sections 150.0(a)
through 150.0(v) also apply to additions or alterations, except that additions or alterations to an
existing single-family residential building which equal or exceed 500 square feet of interior
conditioned space, other than projects identified as all-electric construction for newly constructed
buildings shall also be required to comply with Section 150.0(w).

(d) Section 150.0(w) is added to read as follows

(w) Covered Projects shall select and implement a combination of measures from
the Measure Menu in Table 1, based on building vintage, sufficient to achieve a
total Measure Point Score that meets or exceeds the applicable Target Score
specified in Table 1. All mandatory measures identified in Table 1 must also be
installed, regardless of the total Measure Point Score achieved. Installed measures
shall meet the specifications in Table 2, List of Measure Specifications.

Building vintage is the year in which the original construction permit for the
building was submitted, as documented by department records, or the permit issue
date of an addition or alteration that satisfied the Performance Standards
(California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6, Section 150.1(b)) that were in effect at
that time, whichever is later.

Exceptions to 150.0 (w):

i. Projects that are limited solely to a newly created attached Accessory
Dwelling Units (ADUs) or Junior Accessory Dwelling Unit (JADU) as
defined in §16-52.100 of the Tiburon Municipal Code. A newly
created ADU and JADU shall include either additions or conversions
of existing space.

Page 27 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

ii.

iii.

iv.

Mobile Homes, Manufactured Housing, or Factory-built Housing as
defined in Division 13 of the California Health and Safety 12 Code
(commencing with section 17000 of the Health and Safety Code).

If due to conditions specific to the project, it is technically or
economically infeasible to achieve compliance, the building official
may reduce the Target Score and/or waive some or all of the
mandatory requirements.

If the applicant demonstrates that the Energy Budget of the
proposed building, as calculated under Section 150.1(b), would be less
than or equal to the Energy Budget of the building if it otherwise
complied with this Section, 150.0(w).

A resident owner or occupant demonstrates that they qualify for the
California Alternative Rates for Energy (CARE) or Family Electric
Rate Assistance (FERA) program may comply by installing the
following measures from Table 1:

(a) El1: Lighting Measures; and

(b) E2: Water Heating Package

TABLE 1: MEASURE MENU AND TARGET SCORES

Page 28 of 34

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope I1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

Building Vintage
Pre-
1978 1978-1991 | 1992-2010
Target Score
1D Measure 8 7 2
Energy Measures
El Lighting Measures Mandatory
E2 Water Heating Package 2 2 2
E3 Air Sealing 2 1 1
E4 R-38 Attic Insulation 2 2
E5 Duct Sealing 3 2 1
E6 New Ducts + Duct Sealing 6 4 1
E7 Windows 4 3 4
E§ R-15 Wall Insulation 5
E10 R-19/R-30 Raised Floor Insulation 9/10 9/10
Fuel Substitution Measures
Heat Pump Water Heater (HPWH)
FS1 Replacing Gas 12 12 12
High Efficiency HPWH Replacing
FS2 Gas 13 13 13
FS3 HPWH Replacing Electric 5 5 5
High Efficiency HPWH Replacing
FS4 Electric 6 6 6
FS$S Heat Pump Space Heater 18 13 12
High Efficiency Heat Pump Space
FS6 Heater 19 14 12
FS8 Heat Pump Clothes Dryer | 1 1
FS9 Induction Cooktop 1 1 1
Solar PV and Electric Readiness Measures
Solar PV + Electric Ready Pre-
PV1 Wire 13 13 12
Electric Readiness - Service Mandatory for certain scopes.
ER1 Upgrade See table 2
Mandatory for certain scopes.
ER2 Electric Readiness - End Uses See table 2

The following conditions also apply to Table 1:
(a) Unless otherwise specified, the requirements shall apply to the entire dwelling unit,
not just the additional or altered portion.

Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S.

Page 29 of 34

Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

(b) Measures from the Measure Menu in Table 1 and specified in Table 2, that already
exist in the home, may be counted toward compliance with these requirements, unless
otherwise specified in Table 2.

(c) Measures from the Measure Menu in Table 1 that are to be installed to satisfy
requirements under the State Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6, may not be counted
towards compliance with these requirements. Where these requirements conflict with
other Energy Code requirements, the stricter requirements shall prevail.

TABLE 2: LIST OF MEASURE SPECIFICATIONS

1D I Measure Specifications

Energy Measures

Lighting Measures: Install lighting with an efficiency of 45 lumens per
watt or greater in all interior and exterior screw-in fixtures. Install
photocell, occupancy sensor or energy management system controls that
meet the requirements of 150.0(k)3 in all outdoor lighting permanently
mounted to a residential building or to other buildings on the same lot.
Water Heating Package: Insulate all accessible hot water pipe insulation
a minimum of 3/4 inch thick. This includes insulating the supply pipe
leaving the water heater, piping faucets underneath sinks, and accessible
pipes in attic spaces or crawlspaces. Upgrade fittings in sinks and
showers to meet current California Green Building Standards Code

E2 (Title 24, Part 11) Section 4.303 water efficiency requirements.

El

Exception: Upgraded fixtures are not required if existing fixtures have
rated or measured flow rates of no more than ten percent greater than
2025 California Green Building Standards Code (Title 24, Part 11)
Section 4.303 water efficiency requirements

Air Sealing: Seal all accessible cracks, holes, and gaps in the building
envelope at walls, floors, and ceilings. Pay special attention to
penetrations including plumbing, electrical, and mechanical vents,
recessed can light luminaries, and windows. Weather-strip doors if not
already present. Verification shall be conducted by a certified ECC Rater
no more than three years prior to the permit application date that either:
a) shows at least a 30 percent reduction from pre-retrofit conditions; or
b) shows that the number of air changes per hour at 50 Pascals pressure
difference (ACHS50) does not exceed ten for pre-1978 vintage buildings.
If combustion appliances are located within the pressure boundary of the
building, conduct a combustion safety test by a certified ECC Rater or
professional certified by the Building Performance Institute, in
accordance with the BPI Technical Standards for the Building Analyst
Professional.

E3

Page 30 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope 1D: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDE76C8803E

R-38 Attic Insulation: Attic insulation shall be installed to achieve a
weighted assembly U-factor of 0.025 or insultation installed as the
ceiling level shall have a thermal resistance of R-38 or greater for the
insulation alone. Recessed downlight luminaries in the ceiling shall be
covered with insulation to the same depth as the rest of the ceiling.
Luminaries not rated for insulation contact must be replaced or fitted
with fire-proof cover that allows for insulation to be installed directly
over the cover.

E4

Exception: In buildings where existing R-30 is present and existing
recessed downlight luminaries are not rated for insulation contact,
insulation is not required to be installed over the luminaries.

Duct Sealing: Air seal all space conditioning ductwork to meet the
requirements of 2025 Title 24, Part 6, Section 150.2(b)1E. The duct
system must be tested by an ECC Rater no more than three years prior to
the Covered Project permit application date to verify the duct sealing and
E5 confirm that the requirements have been met. This measure may not be
combined with the New Ducts and Duct Sealing measure in this Table.

Exception: Buildings without ductwork or where the ducts are in
conditioned space

New Ducts + Duct Sealing: Replace existing space conditioning
ductwork with new R-6 ducts that meet the requirements of 2025 Title
E6 24 Section 150.0(m)11. This measure may not be combined with the
Duct Sealing measure in this Table. To qualify, a preexisting measure
must have been installed no more than three years before the Covered
Project permit application date.

Windows: Replace at least 50% of existing windows with high
E7 performance windows with an area-weighted average U-factor no greater

than 0.27.

R-15 Wall Insulation: Install wall insulation in all exterior walls to

E8 achieve a weighted U-factor of 0.095 or install wall insulation in all
exterior wall cavities that shall result in an installed thermal resistance of
R-15 or greater for the insulation alone.

R-19/R-30 Floor Insulation: Raised-floors shall be insulated such that
E10 | the floor assembly has an assembly U-factor equal to or less than U-
0.037/U-0.028, or shall be insulated between wood framing with
insultation having an R-value equal to or great than R-19/R-30

Fuel Substitution Measures
Heat Pump Water Heater (HPWH) Replacing Gas: Replace existing

FS1 | natural gas water heater with a heat pump water heater that meets the
requirements of Sections 110.3 and 150.2(b)1.H.iii.b.

Page 31 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-ESDE76C8803E

High Efficiency HPWH Replacing Gas: Replace existing natural gas
FS2 | water heater with a Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance (NEEA) Tier
3 or higher rating that also meets the requirements of Sections 110.3 and
150.2(b)1.H.iii.c.

HPWH Replacing Electric: Replace existing electric resistance water
heater with a heat pump water heater that meets requirements of Sections
110.3 and 150.2(b)1.H.iii.b.

FS3

High Efficiency HPWH Replacing Electric: Replace existing electric

FS4 | resistance water heater with heat pump water heater with a Northwest
Energy Efficiency Alliance (NEEA) Tier 3 or higher rating that also
meets the requirements of Sections 110.3 and 150.2(b)1.H.iii.c

Heat Pump Space Heater: Replace all existing gas and electric resistance
FS5 primary space heating systems with an electric-only heat pump system
that meets the requirements of Sections 110.3, 150.2(b)1.C, 150.2(b)1L.E,
150.2(b)1.F, and 150.2(b)1.G.

High Efficiency Heat Pump Space Heater: Replace all existing gas and
electric resistance primary space heating systems with a system that
meets the requirements of Sections 110.3 and 150.2(b)1.C, 150.2(b)L.E,
and 150.2(b)1.F, and 150.2(b)1.G and one of the following:

1. A ducted electric-only heat pump system with a SEER2 rating of
16.5 or greater, an EER2 rating of 12.48 or greater and an HSPF2 rating
of 9.5 or greater; or

FSé

2. A ductless mini-split heat pump system with SEER2 rating of 14.3 or
greater, an EER2 rating of 11.7 or greater and an HSPF2 rating of 7.5 or
greater

Heat Pump Clothes Dryer: Replace all existing gas and electric
FS8 | resistance clothes dryers with heat pump dryers with no resistance
element and cap the gas line(s).

Induction Cooktop: Replace all existing gas and electric resistance stove
tops with inductive stove top(s) and cap the gas line(s).

FS9

Solar PV and Electric Readiness Measures

Page 32 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusigr: Envelope ID: 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

Solar PV + Electric Reading Pre-Wire:

For New Solar PV Systems: Install a new solar PV system that meets the
requirements of Section 150.1(c)14. In addition, upgrade the panelboard
to meet the requirements of ER1 and install any two of the other

PV1 | measures from ER2.A - ER2.F

For Existing PV Systems: If the home already has an existing solar PV
system that meets the requirements of Section 150.1(c)14, to claim credit
for this measure, PV 1, upgrade the panelboard to meet the requirements
of ER1 and install any two of the other measures from ER2.A - ER2.F.
Electric Readiness - Service Upgrade: Upgrade the panelboard serving
the individual dwelling unit to provide circuit breaker spaces for a heat
pump water heater, heat pump space heater, electric cooktop and electric
ER1 | clothes dryer with the capacities specified in Section 150.0(n)1, (t), (u),
and (v); or, provide electrical load calculations and appliance
specifications for serving all of these end-uses with a minimum 100-amp
panel.

Electric Readiness - End Uses:

For any covered project, if the service panel is being upgraded or to
claim the Solar PV + Electric Ready Pre-Wire credit, satisfy any two of
the electric-readiness measures below.

If the kitchen is being remodeled make the range electric ready as
specified in ER2, Item C below and upgrade the panelboard as specified
under ERI.

If the laundry room is being remodeled, make the dryer electric ready as
specified in Item D below and upgrade the service panel as specified
under ER1.

Meet the requirements below that otherwise apply to newly constructed
buildings:

A. Heat Pump Water Heater Ready, as specified in Section
150.0(n)1.

Heat Pump Space Heater Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(t)

ER2

Electric Cooktop Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(u)
Electric Clothes Dryer Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(v)

mo aw

Battery Energy Storage Systems (BESS) Ready, as specified in
Section 150.0(s)

EV Charger Ready. Install a dedicated 208/240-volt branch
circuit as specified in the California Green Building Code, Title
24, Part 11, Section A4.106.8.1, which otherwise applies to new
construction.

T

Page 33 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



Docusign Envelope ID; 086490F4-2C72-4881-B502-E9DE76C8803E

Exception: If electrical permit is not otherwise required for the project
other than compliance with the laundry room and kitchen remodel
requirements of this Item, ER2.

Section 4. Severability.

If any section, subsection, clause, sentence, or phrase of this Ordinance is for any reason held to
be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of a Court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of the Ordinance. The Town Council of the
Town of Tiburon hereby declares that it would have passed this Ordinance, any section,
subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, or phrases may be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

Section 5. Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall take effect 30 days after its passage and adoption pursuant to California
Government Code Section 36937, and before the expiration of fifteen (15) days after passage by
the Town Council, a copy of the ordinance shall be published with the names of the members
voting for and against it at least once in a newspaper of general circulation published in the

Town of Tiburon.

This ordinance was introduced at a regular meeting of the Town Council of the Town of Tiburon
on November 19, 2025, and was adopted at a regular meeting of the Town Council of the Town
of Tiburon on December 3, 2025 by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCILMEMBERS: Fredericks, Nikfar, Thier, Welner
NAYS: COUNCILMEMBERS: None
ABSENT: COUNCILMEMBERS: Ryan
DocuSigned by:A
gg Z P '
?Esﬁ mrum’x(‘nm/ %‘
HOLLI THEIR, MAYOR
TOWN OF TIBURON

ATTEST:

DocuSigned by:
32443

LEA DILENA, TOWN CLERK

Page 34 of 34
Town of Tiburon Ordinance No. 615 N.S. Effective 1/4/26



